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The Novena to St. Jude 
 
Saint Jude is the patron of Hopeless 
Causes and Desperate Situations. 

Pray these novena prayers to Saint 
Jude with confidence. Catholics have 
relied on his intercession in times of 
extreme need for centuries. 

This Apostle and Martyr has helped 
countless souls through his epistle in 
the New Testament and his 
intercessions on behalf of those who 
seek his aid in times of trial. 

Pray this novena for your intentions 
asking St. Jude to intercede to God the 
Father, His Son Jesus Christ and the 
Holy Spirit on your behalf. 

Saint Jude was one of Jesus’ twelve 
original apostles, so we can conclude 

that he was also at the Last Supper. 
Saint Jude is also known by the name 
Thaddeus, which means sweetness and 
gentleness of character. 

He is not the traitor Judas Iscariot. 

Saint Jude, rather, followed Jesus 
faithfully until his crucifixion, and 
then later worked on evangelization. 
Very little is known about his life, but 
we do know that he died as a martyr — 
some say around 65AD, giving his life 
to Jesus Christ. 

He is now one of the most invoked 
saints for intercession in desperate 
situations because his New Testament 
letter stressed the importance of a 
faithful person persevering in the 
environment of harsh circumstances.
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 The Saint Jude Novena Prayers

Day 1 – St. Jude Novena 

Most holy St. Jude – apostle, martyr 
and friend of Jesus, today I ask that 
you pray for me and my intentions! 

(State your intentions here) 

You are the patron of the impossible. 
Pray for me and my intentions! O St. 
Jude, pray that God’s grace and mercy 
will cover my intentions. Pray for the 
impossible if it is God’s will. 

Pray that I may have the grace to 
accept God’s holy will even if it is 
painful and difficult for me. 

St. Jude, you loved our Lord, help me 
to love Him more. 

O St. Jude, pray for me that I may 
grow in faith, hope and love and in the 
grace of Jesus Christ. Pray for these 
intentions, but most of all pray that I 

may join you in heaven with God for 
all eternity.  

Amen. 

Day 2 – St. Jude Novena 

Most holy St. Jude – apostle, martyr 
and friend of Jesus, today I ask that 
you pray for me and my intentions! 

(State your intentions here) 

You are the patron of the impossible. 
Pray for me and my intentions! O St. 
Jude, pray that God’s grace and mercy 
will cover my intentions. Pray for the 
impossible if it is God’s will. 

Pray that I may have the grace to 
accept God’s holy will even if it is 
painful and difficult for me. 

St. Jude, pray that I may have your 
zeal to preach the Gospel. 
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O St. Jude, pray for me that I may 
grow in faith, hope and love and in the 
grace of Jesus Christ. Pray for these 
intentions, but most of all pray that I 
may join you in heaven with God for 
all eternity.  

Amen. 

Day 3 – St. Jude Novena 

Most holy St. Jude – apostle, martyr 
and friend of Jesus, today I ask that 
you pray for me and my intentions! 

(State your intentions here) 

You are the patron of the impossible. 
Pray for me and my intentions! O St. 
Jude, pray that God’s grace and mercy 
will cover my intentions. Pray for the 
impossible if it is God’s will. 

Pray that I may have the grace to 
accept God’s holy will even if it is 
painful and difficult for me. 

St. Jude, you labored for years, pray 
that I may have patience in my 
struggles. 

O St. Jude, pray for me that I may 
grow in faith, hope and love and in the 
grace of Jesus Christ. Pray for these 
intentions, but most of all pray that I 
may join you in heaven with God for 
all eternity.  

Amen. 

Day 4 – St. Jude Novena 

Most holy St. Jude – apostle, martyr 
and friend of Jesus, today I ask that 
you pray for me and my intentions! 

(State your intentions here) 

You are the patron of the impossible. 
Pray for me and my intentions! O St. 
Jude, pray that God’s grace and mercy 
will cover my intentions. Pray for the 
impossible if it is God’s will. 

Pray that I may have the grace to 
accept God’s holy will even if it is 
painful and difficult for me. 

St. Jude, you are known for answering 
lost causes, pray for my most 
impossible needs.  
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O St. Jude, pray for me that I may 
grow in faith, hope and love and in the 
grace of Jesus Christ. Pray for these 
intentions, but most of all pray that I 
may join you in heaven with God for 
all eternity.  

Amen. 

Day 5 – St. Jude Novena 

Most holy St. Jude – apostle, martyr 
and friend of Jesus, today I ask that 
you pray for me and my intentions! 

(State your intentions here) 

You are the patron of the impossible. 
Pray for me and my intentions! O St. 
Jude, pray that God’s grace and mercy 
will cover my intentions. Pray for the 
impossible if it is God’s will. 

Pray that I may have the grace to 
accept God’s holy will even if it is 
painful and difficult for me. 

St. Jude, you sacrificed for the 
Kingdom of God, pray that I may 
sacrifice like you. 

O St. Jude, pray for me that I may 
grow in faith, hope and love and in the 
grace of Jesus Christ. Pray for these 
intentions, but most of all pray that I 
may join you in heaven with God for 
all eternity.  

Amen. 

Day 6 – St. Jude Novena 

Most holy St. Jude – apostle, martyr 
and friend of Jesus, today I ask that 
you pray for me and my intentions! 

(State your intentions here) 

You are the patron of the impossible. 
Pray for me and my intentions! O St. 
Jude, pray that God’s grace and mercy 
will cover my intentions. Pray for the 
impossible if it is God’s will. 

Pray that I may have the grace to 
accept God’s holy will even if it is 
painful and difficult for me. 

St. Jude, pray that I may know God’s 
will in my life. 
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O St. Jude, pray for me that I may 
grow in faith, hope and love and in the 
grace of Jesus Christ. Pray for these 
intentions, but most of all pray that I 
may join you in heaven with God for 
all eternity.  

Amen. 

Day 7 – St. Jude Novena 

Most holy St. Jude – apostle, martyr 
and friend of Jesus, today I ask that 
you pray for me and my intentions! 

(State your intentions here) 

You are the patron of the impossible. 
Pray for me and my intentions! O St. 
Jude, pray that God’s grace and mercy 
will cover my intentions. Pray for the 
impossible if it is God’s will. 

Pray that I may have the grace to 
accept God’s holy will even if it is 
painful and difficult for me. 

St. Jude, pray that I may put my trust 
in God that He knows my needs even 
better than I do and that He provides. 

O St. Jude, pray for me that I may 
grow in faith, hope and love and in the 
grace of Jesus Christ. Pray for these 
intentions, but most of all pray that I 
may join you in heaven with God for 
all eternity.  

Amen. 

Day 8 – St. Jude Novena 

Most holy St. Jude – apostle, martyr 
and friend of Jesus, today I ask that 
you pray for me and my intentions! 

(State your intentions here) 

You are the patron of the impossible. 
Pray for me and my intentions! O St. 
Jude, pray that God’s grace and mercy 
will cover my intentions. Pray for the 
impossible if it is God’s will. 

Pray that I may have the grace to 
accept God’s holy will even if it is 
painful and difficult for me. 

St. Jude, pray for me that I will not 
lose hope. 
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O St. Jude, pray for me that I may 
grow in faith, hope and love and in the 
grace of Jesus Christ. Pray for these 
intentions, but most of all pray that I 
may join you in heaven with God for 
all eternity.  

Amen. 

Day 9 – St. Jude Novena 

Most holy St. Jude – apostle, martyr 
and friend of Jesus, today I ask that 
you pray for me and my intentions! 

(State your intentions here) 

You are the patron of the impossible. 
Pray for me and my intentions! O St. 
Jude, pray that God’s grace and mercy 
will cover my intentions. Pray for the 
impossible if it is God’s will. 

Pray that I may have the grace to 
accept God’s holy will even if it is 
painful and difficult for me. 

St. Jude, pray for me that I will not 
lose faith. 

O St. Jude, pray for me that I may 
grow in faith, hope and love and in the 
grace of Jesus Christ. Pray for these 
intentions, but most of all pray that I 
may join you in heaven with God for 
all eternity.  

Amen. 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 


